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(JUIT -Paraxel Researcher Experience)

Expert: Profile – Ms.Neha Kapoor
Sr. Manager, Paraxel India Pvt. Ltd. 

 Ms Neha Kapoor, Sr. Manager Paraxel India Pvt. Ltd- Mohali-Punjab. She has a 
successful and proven track record in managing the medical writing with vast 
experience of authoring/reviewing. She explained the same during her talk.Her 
work included:-Aggregate reports including but not limited to Periodic Safety 
Reports (PSRs) including Periodic Safety Update Reports (PSURs), Periodic 
Benefit-Risk Evaluation Reports (PBRERs), Addendum to Clinical Overviews 
(ACOs), Semi-Annual Safety Reports (SASRs), Corporate Addendum Reports 
States Periodic Adverse Drug Experience Reports (PADERs).Ms.Neha’s talk was 
very interactive and students were inquisitive about phases of clinical trials of 
drugs and skills to be acquired to attach with Industry. 

 Ms Kapoor also responsible for end-to-end signal management process (as 
applicable), generating Line Listings, creating drug lists/drug folders, performing 
regulatory submissions, tests electronic submissions gateways, tracking compliance 
monitoring of submissions in accordance with client/international conventions (as 
applicable), responsible for preparing the narratives associated with the 
client’s/sponsor’s products from clinical trials for Clinical Study Reports (CSRs) or 
in order to support any health authority requests in accordance with regulatory and 
client’s/sponsor’s requirements (as applicable).

 Paraxel Indiais among the leading clinical research organizations (CROs) working 
on different therapeutics areas including Oncology, Infectious Disease, 
Inflammation, General Medicine and providing the full range of Phase I to IV 
clinical development services to help life-saving treatments reach patients faster.

 Ms.Neha Kapoor visited the campus of JUIT and research facility in the 
department of Biotechnology and Bioinformaticsshe was impressed with research 
and study environment here.

 Ms. Kapoor interacted with faculty member, Ph.D. scholars and discussed their 
field of interest, he appreciated the research work carried out by faculty in the 
department of Biotechnology and Bioinformatics.

 Ms. Kapoorwas very positive to start collaborative certificate program in 
Pharmacovigilance. She was very positive for paraxel –JUIT collaborative research 

 We have discussed the possibility of student training/internship at Paraxelin near 
future.

 After meeting, Ms. Kapoorwas very positive for more and more meeting or visit in 
JUIT in near future.
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